

CITY OF CONCORD - BID TABULATION**BID 2281 - ELECTRIC SYSTEM CREWS**

DATE: 4/20/2016

TIME: 2:00 PM

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>WILLIAMS ELECTRIC</u>	<u>PIKE ELECTRIC</u>	<u>T & D SOLUTIONS</u>	<u>SUMTER UTILITIES</u>	<u>LEE ELECTRICAL CONSTRUCTION</u>	<u>UTILITY LINES CONSTRUCTION</u>
TOTAL BASIC OVERHEAD CREW COST PER HOUR	\$268.77	\$337.06	NO BID	\$345.39	\$283.50	\$295.88
TOTAL MISC. OVERHEAD EQUIPMENT PER HOUR	\$18.00	\$19.84	NO BID	\$21.09	\$30.00	\$21.47
TOTAL MISC. TRANSMISSION PER HOUR	\$119.75	\$186.17	NO BID	\$275.64	\$218.05	\$228.68
TOTAL BASIC UNDERGROUND CREW COST PER HOUR	\$262.34	\$350.23	NO BID	\$329.98	\$311.50	\$323.70
TOTAL BASIC SERVICE CREW COST PER HOUR	\$205.96	\$289.52	NO BID	\$270.62	\$207.25	\$255.95
TOTAL BASIC CREW COST UNDERGROUND - DE-ENERGIZED PER HOUR	\$189.64	\$270.24	NO BID	\$238.48	\$190.50	\$226.09
<u>MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT</u>						
WIRE PULLING EQUIPMENT PER HOUR	\$18.00	\$19.84	NO BID	\$21.10	\$30.00	\$26.40
AERIAL BUCKET 61' TO 80' PER HOUR	\$31.00	\$41.51	NO BID	\$62.70	\$52.00	\$50.91
AERIAL BUCKET 81' TO 105' PER HOUR	\$32.00	\$52.67	NO BID	\$72.20	\$65.00	\$75.63
1 - FOUR WIRE TRAILER PER HOUR	\$1.00	\$5.46	NO BID	\$17.30	\$4.85	\$3.35
1 - DUMP TRUCK PER HOUR	\$14.00	\$11.65	NO BID	\$16.70	\$20.00	\$20.65
1 - VENT BLOWER PER HOUT	\$1.00	\$2.89	NO BID	\$10.00	\$5.00	\$2.75
1 - UNDERDOG WIRE PULLER PER HOUR	\$7.50	\$8.74	NO BID	\$8.40	\$14.00	\$9.30
1 - LARGE EXAVATOR (200+ HP) PER HOUR	\$38.00	\$65.00	NO BID	\$22.80	\$75.00	\$49.78
1 - ROCK BUSTER FOR USE WITH LARGE EXCAVATOR PER HOUR	\$9.00	\$21.50	NO BID	\$8.40	\$13.00	\$9.35
TOTAL SUBSTATION MAINTENANCE CREW PER HOUR	\$132.08	\$280.82	NO BID	\$115.50	\$131.00	\$235.86
TOTAL GENERAL FOREMAN PER HOUR	\$32.00	\$37.40	NO BID	\$40.00	\$34.00	\$34.00

BIDDER

WILLIAMS ELECTRIC	PIKE ELECTRIC	T & D SOLUTIONS	SUMTER UTILITIES	LEE ELECTRICAL CONSTRUCTION	UTILITY LINES CONSTRUCTION
------------------------------	--------------------------	--------------------------------	-----------------------------	--	---

EMERGENCY CREW AVAILABILITY

OVERHEAD LINE CONSTRUCTION CREWS:

NUMBER OF CREWS WITHIN 50 MILES	28	75	NO BID	8	10	76
NUMBER OF CREWS WITHIN 100 MILES	34	220	NO BID	18	15	83

UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION CREWS:

NUMBER OF CREWS WITHIN 50 MILES	3	90	NO BID	5	4	36
NUMBER OF CREWS WITHIN 100 MILES	4	150	NO BID	10	8	52

SUBSTATION EQUIPMENT TESTING

1 - TURN RATIO TEST PER TRANSFORMER	\$500.00	\$1,951.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$952.00	\$1,425.00
1 - POWER FACTOR (DOUBLE) TEST PER TRANSFORMER	\$3,000.00	\$1,951.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,250.00	\$1,425.00

<i>BID BOND</i>	YES	YES	NO BID	YES	YES	YES
-----------------	-----	-----	--------	-----	-----	-----